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Abstract 

This study explores the relationship between disclosure quality and corporate governance in 
Tehran stock exchange (TSE). In this study, the mechanisms of corporate governance are 
consist of internal audit, ownership concentration, CEO duality, board independence, board 
size, board chairman independence, and chairman tenure. On the other hand, the measure of 
disclosure quality calculated by the Stock Exchange Organization (SEO) has been used as a 
proxy for disclosure quality. Using a sample of 83 accepted firms on Tehran Stock Exchange 
(TSE) over the period from 2005 to 2010, the results reveal that there is a significant and 
positive relationship disclosure quality and each of independent variables such as internal 
audit, ownership concentration, CEO duality, board independence, and chairman 
independence, but no association between disclosure quality and each of board size and 
chairman tenure. 
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1. Introduction   

Considering the process of the disclosure of the information, the investors deal with 
informational asymmetry. This problem arises when one of the two parties to a deal has more 
information than the other (Graham, Koski, & Loewenstein, 2006). The role of the 
responsible individuals of the information disclosure is indicated in the corporate governance 
which includes monitoring and the procedures to make sure that not only the firm 
management does not have incentive to make their own profits but also they attempt to 
increase the interests of the investors and the firm value (Kanagaretnam, Lobo, & Whalen, 
2007). The appropriate application of the corporate governance mechanisms is a basic step to 
use optimum resources, increasing the responsibility, transparency, regarding the justice and 
the rights of the parties who have interests in the firm (Jalali, 2008). The high level of 
disclosure quality is useful for the firm because it has the potential to decrease the cost of 
capital (Botosan, 1997; Diamond & Verrecchia, 1991; Lev, 1992), meaning that it may lead 
to decreasing the expense of the debt (Sengupta, 1998) and increasing the stock price (Healy, 
Hutton, & Palepu, 1999; Lang & Lundholm, 2000; Welker, 1995). However, if the given 
information by the managers is not completed, the firms will not get all of the advantages. 
Considering the motivations of managing for information disclosure, it is possible that the 
information disclosure be distorted (Donnelly & Mulcahy, 2008). The low level of 
information disclosure causes inappropriate allocation of the resources in the stock market, 
since it causes that the investors make economic decisions based on wrong information 
(Cerbioni & Parbonetti, 2007). The current study investigates if the corporate governance 
mechanisms influence on the information disclosure quality. 

2. Literature Review   

Klein (1998) investigates about the role of the non-independent directors and independent 
directors, in undertaking the duties of the decision management and decision control, and she 
required some documents in the case of the value of the presence of non-independent 
directors in control committees such as the audit committee and supervisory committee to the 
financial reporting quality (Nikoomaram & Badavar Nahandi, 2009). Lakhal (2005) examines 
the relationship between the voluntary disclosure of the French firms’ managers and the 
mechanisms of corporate governance. The results show that if the ownership structure is 
pretty dispersed and has more non-independent managers on board, the level of voluntary 
disclosure will be increased. The duality in managing director’s duties will probably decrease 
the level of the voluntary disclosure of the information. There is a small relationship among 
the number of the board independent members and making decision about voluntary 
disclosure and board size and voluntary disclosure. The results of the research indicate a 
negative relationship between board size and voluntary disclosure which is not what they 
expected. The relationship between the firm characteristics, the corporate governance rules 
and the level of voluntary disclosure in Spain was explored by Babío Arcay and Muiño 
Vázquez (2005). The results of the study show that the ratio of independent directors on the 
board of directors, the existence of the audit committee in the firm and the cooperation of the 
board of directors in the firm investment and also offering the stock option plans to the 
managers as the fee, are related to the disclosure. Cheng and Courtenay (2006) analyze the 
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relationship between the ratio of independent directors on the board of directors, the board 
size and also the duality of the managing director’s duties with voluntary disclosure. The 
results indicate that the ratio of the independent directors is directly related to the level of 
voluntary disclosure and also the board size and the duality of the managing director’s duties 
are not related to the voluntary disclosure. Akhtaruddin, Hossain, Hossain, and Yao (2009) 
investigate the relationship between corporate governance and voluntary disclosure of 
information in annual reports. The results demonstrate that there is a positive association 
between the board size and the voluntary disclosure of the information and also between the 
number of the independent managers and voluntary disclosure of information. Nevertheless, 
the level of the voluntary disclosure has a negative relationship with family control, but there 
is no relationship between the ratio of the audit committee members to total number of 
directors on the board and voluntary disclosure of information.  

Sajadi, Zaranejad, and Jafari (2009) investigate the non-financial characteristics effectiveness 
to the quality of the financial reporting in accepted firms on Tehran Stock Exchange. The 
results reveal that the size of the firm, the age of the firm and the type of the industry have a 
positive and significant relationship and the ownership structure has a negative relationship 
with the financial reporting quality, but type of audit firm is not significantly associated with 
financial reporting quality. Khodadadi, Khazami, and Aflatooni (2010) explore “the effect of 
corporate governance structure on the extent of voluntary disclosure in Iran”. In their study, 
the corporate governance mechanisms were the ratio of the independent directors on the 
board of directors, the percentage of the institutional investors and the duality of the 
managing director and the chairman of board of directors’ duties. Using a sample of 106 
accepted firms on Tehran Stock Exchange (TSE) during period from 2001 to 2005, the results 
indicate that there is a significant relationship between the ratio of the independent directors 
and duality in the managing director’s duties with the level of voluntary disclosure. In 
addition, the results document a significant association between the percentage of the 
institutional investors and the level of voluntary disclosure of information. Using a sample of 
accepted firms on Tehran Stock Exchange over the period from 2002 to 2009, Khoshbakht 
and Mohammadzadeh Salteh (2011) investigate the relationship between the corporate 
governance mechanisms and the discretionary disclosure of information. In their study, the 
corporate governance mechanisms include the percentage of the board independent members, 
the ownership concentration, institutional ownership, free floating stocks and the type of the 
firm auditor. The results reveal that the relationship between the percentage of the 
independent directors on board and institutional ownership with the level of the discretionary 
disclosure of information in the firms is significant, but they report no significant relationship 
between three mechanisms of the corporate governance such as ownership concentration, free 
floating stocks and the type of the firm auditor and the level of the discretionary disclosure of 
information.  

Aburaya (2012) examines the relationship between the corporate governance and the 
environmental disclosure quality of the firm. The results designate that there is significant 
association between the environmental disclosure quality of the big firms and the 
mechanisms of corporate governance. The results also report a negative and association 
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between CEO duality and environmental disclosure quality, indicating that holding position 
of the managing director and board chairman by the same person reduce environmental 
disclosure quality, but a positive and significant association board meetings and 
environmental disclosure quality, suggesting that the more the number of board meetings, the 
more the quality of environmental disclosure. In a similar way, Katmun (2012) investigates 
the effective factors on disclosure quality. The results show that there is a significant positive 
relationship between each of audit committee, number of board meetings, board 
independence and disclosure quality. 

2.1.  Research Hypotheses 

According to the abovementioned literature, seven hypotheses are developed as follows:  

H1: there is a significant relationship between internal audit unit and disclosure quality. 

H2: there is a significant relationship between ownership concentration and disclosure 
quality. 

H3: there is a significant relationship between CEO duality and disclosure quality. 

H4: there is a significant relationship between board independence and disclosure quality. 

H5: there is a significant relationship between board size and disclosure quality. 

H6: there is a significant relationship between board chairman independence and disclosure 
quality. 

H7: there is a significant relationship between chairman tenure and disclosure quality.  

3. Research Methodology  

This research is a type of correlational and regression analysis and hence will investigate the 
correlation between dependent variable and independent variables. Since the data are of 
cross-section and time-series type, the panel data models (fixed or random effects) are used to 
test the hypotheses.  

3.1. Sample Selection and Data Sources  

The sample consists of 83 accepted firms on the Tehran Stock Exchange (TSE) during the 
period from 2005 to 2010 (5 fiscal years), and accordingly 498 firm-year observations are 
used. Data required to test the hypotheses are collected using data sources such as compact 
disks (CDs) issued by Tehran Stock Exchange Organization, TadbirPardaz database and other 
sites of Stock Exchange Organization. 

3.2. Variables Definition  

3.2.1. Measuring Dependent Variable 

1. Disclosure quality (DQ) is the dependent variable in this study. To measure this variable, 
the annual report under title "ranking firms by disclosure quality score" is employed in which 
each firm is given a score by Tehran Stock Exchange Organization (TSEO) annually. 
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3.2.2. Measuring Independent Variables 

1. Internal audit (IA): to measure this variable, a dummy variable is used where internal 
audit (IA) set to "1" if firm has internal audit unit and zero "0" otherwise.  

2. Ownership concentration (OWNCON): Ownership concentration is measured as the ratio 
of common shares owned by concentrated shareholders over total shares outstanding by 
firms.  

3. CEO duality (CEOD): A dummy variable is used to measure the CEO duality where 
CEO duality equals "1" if chief executive director is not board chairman and zero "0" 
otherwise. 

4. Board independence (BODIND): this variable is measured as the number of independent 
directors on board divided by total number of board of directors.  

5. Board size (BODS): board size is defined as the number of total number of board of 
directors who may be independent or non-independent directors. 

6. Board chairman independence (BODCI): board chairman independence (BODCI) is 
measured by a dummy variable where board chairman independence (BODCI) set to "1" if 
the chairman of the board is a non-executive director and zero "0" otherwise.  

7. Chairman tenure (CHAIRTEN): chairman tenure is measured as the number of years the 
chairman had held that position in a given firm. 

3.2.3. Measuring Control Variables 

1. Financial leverage (LEV): financial leverage as a control variable is measured as the total 
debts liabilities over total assets.  

2. Firm size (FSIZE): firm size is the control variable which is measured by the natural 
logarithm of total assets of the firm at the end of the fiscal year. 

3.3. Model Specification 

DQ = β1 + β2 (IA) + β3 (OWNCON) + β4 (CEOD) + β5 (BODIND) + β6 (BODS)  

+ β7 (BODCI) + β8 (CHAIRTEN) + β9 (LEV) + β10 (FSIZE) + ε 

Where:  

DQ = Disclosure quality 
IAU = Internal audit  

OWNCON = Ownership concentration 
CEOD = CEO duality 

BODIND = Board independence 
BODS = Board size 

BODCI = Board chairman independence 
CHAIRTEN = Chairman tenure 

LEV = Financial leverage 
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FSIZE = Firm size 

4. Empirical Results 

4.1. Descriptive Statistics 

Usually the most useful and first step in organizing data is ordering data based on a logical 
criterion and then acquiring the central indexes and distribution. Totally, by appropriate using 
of descriptive (statistics) methods, the characteristics of one group of the information can be 
expressed exactly. Descriptive statistics is always used for determining and expressing the 
characteristics of research information. Therefore, in this section descriptive statistics of 
variables in research will be investigated, which is presented in table 1. The numbers present 
a general statue of the research data distribution.  

The most significant central index is mean which indicates the balance point and the center of 
distribution and also is a good index to show the centrality of the data. Median is another 
central index which shows the statue of population. In general, distribution parameters are 
criteria to determine the level of distribution of each other or distribution to the mean. The 
range indicates the range of the largest number and smallest number. One of the most 
important distribution parameters is standard deviation. Among the research variables, 
ownership concentration and board tenure has the highest and the lowest distribution 
respectively. The level of asymmetry of the frequency graph is called skewness. If skewness 
coefficient is 0, the population will completely be symmetric and if the coefficient is positive, 
skewness will be towards the right side and if the coefficient is negative, skewness will be 
towards the left side of the graph. The size of the firm has the most asymmetry and disclosure 
quality has the less asymmetry to the normal distribution. 

Table 1. Descriptive Statistics   

Variables DQ IAU OWNCON CEOD BODIND BODS BODCI CHAIRTEN LEV FSIZE

Mean    

50.10 

    

0.55 

   0.436    

0.85 

   0.61    

5.18 

   0.77    3.71    

0.73 

   

5.86 

Median    50     

1.00 

   0.41    

1.00 

   0.60    

5.00 

   1.00    2.00    

0.77 

   

5.80 

Maximum    98     

1.00 

   0.89    

1.00 

   1.00  10.00    1.00  20.00    

3.33 

   

8.64 

Minimum −13     

0.00 

   0.12    

0.00 

   0.00    

3.00 

   0.00    1.00    

0.01 

   

2.80 

St.Dev   25.9     

0.497 

   0.19    

0.36 

   0.22    

0.62 

   0.49    3.78    

0.29 

   

0.65 

Skewness   

−0.16 

  −0.22    0.38  −1.84  −0.39    

3.16 

 −1.30    2.09    

1.72 

   

0.42 

Observations 498 498 498 498 498 498 498 498 498 498 

Note: DQ = disclosure quality; IA= internal audit; OWNCON = ownership concentration; CEOD = CEO duality; BODIND = board 

independence; BODS = board size; BODCI = board chairman independence; CHAIRTEN = chairman tenure; LEV = financial 

leverage; FSIZE = firm size 
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4.2. Pearson Correlation 

To determine the level of the relationship among the variables, Pearson correlation 
coefficient has been used. Correlation coefficient is a statistical way to measure the level that 
a variable can be related to another variable linearly. The correlation coefficient should not be 
high among the variables of model. Gujarati (2003) argues that as a thumb of rule, correlation 
coefficient more than 0.8 is regarded as high correlation and hence indicates a serious 
problem of multicollinearity. Since the high correlation among the independent variables in a 
model, may lead to spoiling the results of regression. When the significance coefficient of a 
variable is less than 5% (sig<5%), H0 will be rejected and H1 will be cofirmed and 
significance of the two variables will be acceptable otherwise it will be unacceptable. As it is 
seen in the table, the level of correlation among the research variables indicates a significant 
correlation among the most of the variables, and therefore the results indicate that there is no 
multicollinearity between our variables.  

Table 2. Pearson Correlation Matrix 

 DQ IAU OWNCON CEOD BODIND BODS BODCI CHAIRTEN LEV FSIZE

DQ   1.00          

IAU   

0.29* 

  1.00         

OWNCON   

0.10* 

−0.12   1.00        

CEOD   

0.32* 

  0.02*   0.02   1.00       

BODIND   

0.33* 

  0.17*   0.14*   0.57*   1.00      

BODS −0.02   0.00   0.04 −0.07 −0.02   1.00     

BODCI   

0.23* 

  0.08   0.15*   0.65*   0.59* −0.04   1.00    

CHAIRTEN   0.00 −0.07   0.04* −0.08 −0.03   0.09   0.00   1.00   

LEV   0.03 −0.16* −0.03   0.16*   0.10* −0.04 −0.04   0.10*   

1.00 

 

FSIZE −0.04 −0.07   0.36*   0.06   0.08   

0.21* 

  0.12* −0.17*   

0.09 

  1.00 

Note: DQ = disclosure quality; IAU= internal audit unit; OWNCON = ownership concentration; CEOD = CEO duality; BODIND = board 

independence; BODS = board size; BODCI = board chairman independence; CHAIRTEN = chairman tenure; LEV = leverage; FSIZE = 

firm size 

4.3. Regression Results and Discussion  

According to the results of Hausman-test, the most suitable estimation method for all models 
is random effects. Therefore all models are run based on random effects estimation method. 
In model1, (F=21.33) statistics, indicates the significance of regression model1 that since 
P-Value<5%, and hence regression model1 is significant. R2 = 29% also indicates the level of 
the relationship of the independent variables with disclosure quality (dependent variable). 
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Internal audit unit independent variable is significant and indicates a positive and significant 
relationship between internal audit unit and disclosure quality as 15.91%. Therefore, the first 
hypothesis is not rejected since our results support it. The control variables in this model are 
not significant as well. In model2, (F=14.87) statistics, indicates the significance of 
regression model2 that since P-Value<5%, regression model is significant. R2 = 22% also 
indicates the level of the relationship of the independent variables with disclosure quality 
(dependent variable). Ownership concentration independent variable is significant and 
indicates a positive and significant relationship between ownership concentration and 
disclosure quality as 20.13%. Therefore, the second hypothesis is not rejected since our 
results support it. The size of the firm as control variable is significant as well and it is equal 
to −6.34. In model3, (F=18.30) statistics, indicates the significance of regression model3 that 
since P-Value<5%, regression model3 is significant. R2 = 26% also indicates the level of the 
relationship of the independent variables with disclosure quality (dependent variable). CEO 
duality as an independent variable is significant and indicates a positive and significant 
relationship between CEO duality and disclosure quality as 18.77%. Therefore, the third 
hypothesis is not rejected since our results support it. The size of the firm as control variable 
is significant as well and it is equal to −2.36. In model4, (F=19) statistics, indicates the 
significance of regression model4 that since P-Value<5%, regression model4 is significant. 
R2 = 27% also indicates the level of the relationship of the independent and control variables 
with disclosure quality (dependent variable). Board independence as an independent variable 
is significant and indicates a positive and significant relationship between board 
independence and disclosure quality as 30.29%. Therefore, the fourth hypothesis is not 
rejected since our results support it. The size of the firm as control variable is significant as 
well and it is equal to −4.61. In model5, (F=13.52) statistics, indicates the significance of 
regression model5 that since P-Value<5%, regression model5 is significant. R2 = 21% also 
indicates the level of the relationship of the independent variables with disclosure quality 
(dependent variable). Board size as an independent variable is not significant (P-Value = 
0.34). Therefore, fifth hypothesis is rejected because our result does not support it. The size 
of the firm as control variable is significant as well and it is equal to −4.41. In model6, 
(F=15.44) statistics, indicates the significance of regression model6 that since P-Value<5%, 
regression model6 is significant. R2 = 23% also indicates the level of the relationship of the 
independent variables with disclosure quality (dependent variable). Board chairman 
independence as an independent variable is significant and indicates a positive and significant 
relationship between board chairman independence and disclosure quality as 10.26%. 
Therefore, the sixth hypothesis is not rejected since our results support it. The size of the firm 
as control variable is significant as well and it is equal to −4.7. In model7, (F=13.41) 
statistics, indicates the significance of regression model7 that since P-Value<5%, regression 
model7 is significant. R2 = 21% also indicates the level of the relationship of the independent 
variables with disclosure quality (dependent variable). The chairman tenure as an 
independent variable is not significant (P-Value =0.6). Therefore, seventh hypothesis is 
rejected because our result does not support it. The size of the firm as control variable is 
significant as well and it is equal to −3.8. 
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Table 3. Multivariate Analysis 

5. Conclusion  

More and better disclosure of information is one of the effective and important characteristics 
and factors in investors' economic decisions and also one of the appropriate characteristics in 
competitive markets. The firms with stronger systems of corporate governance and 
appropriate monitoring may have more ability to impact on the firm management in order to 
disclose more and better information. The mentioned firms have the better qualitative indexes 
of the market and their stocks prices are less influenced by the deals and the possibility for 
dealing in these firms is at a low level based on confidential information, that is, the 
asymmetry of information is less and these firms lead to the efficiency of the capital market 
(Khoshbakht & Mohammadzadeh Salteh, 2011). In this research, the association between 
corporate governance and disclosure quality has been investigated. Using a sample of 83 
listed firms on Tehran Stocks Exchange (TSE) during period from 2005 to 2010, the results 
indicate that there is a significant and direct relationship between disclosure quality and 
explanatory variables such as internal audit, ownership concentration, CEO duality, board 

Independent Variables Model1 Model2 Model3 Model4 Model5 Model6 Model7 

Constant 56.33 

(0.000) 

77.07 

(0.000) 

61.12 

(0.000) 

60 

(0.000) 

66.02 

(0.000) 

69.55 

(0.000) 

71.63 

(0.000) 

Internal Audit  15.91* 

(0.000) 

− 

− 

− 

− 

− − 

− 

− 

− 

− 

− 

Concentration − 20.13* 

(0.000) 

− − − − − 

CEO Duality − − 18.77* 

(0.000) 

− − − − 

Board Independence − − − 30.29* 

(0.000) 

− − − 

Board size − − − − 1.81 

(0.34) 

− − 

Board Chairman 

Independence 

− − − − − 10.26* 

(0.000) 

− 

Chairman Tenure − − − − − − 0.16 

(0.6) 

Financial leverage 5.02 

(0.2) 

1.375 

(0.7) 

-0.7 

(0.47) 

-1.49 

(0.7) 

0.74 

(0.8) 

0.26 

(0.94) 

0.29 

(0.9) 

Firm Size −1.74 

(0.08) 

−6.34* 

(0.00) 

−2.36* 

(0.01) 

−4.61* 

(0.01) 

−4.41* 

(0.02) 

−4.7* 

(0.01) 

−3.8* 

(0.04) 

F 21.33 

(0.00) 

14.87 

(0.00) 

18.30 

(0.00) 

19 

(0.00) 

13.52 

(0.00) 

15.44 

(0.00) 

13.41 

(0.00) 

R2 29% 22% 26% 27% 21% 23% 21% 

No of Observations 498 498 498 498 498 498 498 
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independence, and board chairman independence. However, our findings reveal that 
disclosure quality is not significantly associated with board size and chairman tenure of the 
board. 
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