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Abstract 

The aim of this study is to display how efficient the airline companies use their websites to 
announce their mission statements to stakeholders. This qualitative research, for which 
content analysis is used, has a sample group of 252 companies. It has been determined that 
70% of the companies announce their mission statements on their websites, 40% of them do 
it under the title “Our Mission”, the companies usually give two language options (native and 
English), even if there are more, they are usually not available for mission statements, the 
most frequent location for the mission statement is the second, the least frequent is the 
homepage. This study concludes that the websites are not being used efficiently to reach their 
stakeholders. 
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1. Introduction 

Mission is a crucial and comprehensive statement that explains the purpose of existence of an 
organization, exhibits the distinguishing philosophy, values and main objective among similar 
organizations and defines the operations, products/services, market and responsibilities of the 
organization (Bart, 1996, 1999; Drucker, 1973; Klemm, Sanderson & Luffman, 1991; Want, 
1986). 

Management literature consists of numerous views regarding the benefits to be derived from 
designation of a mission and sharing the mission with the stakeholders (e.g., Campbell, 1997; 
Ireland & Hitt, 1992; Rigby, 1998). Besides, mission statements are seen as a significant 
marketing and public relations tool. Furthermore, mission statements have become an 
important part of stakeholder relations and reputation management of today’s companies 
(Leuthesser & Kohli, 1997). Taking all of these characteristics into consideration, a mission 
statement indeed is a public statement (Bartkus & Glassman, 2008).  

Companies may utilize various tools in order to convey their mission statements to their 
internal and external stakeholders. If compared with booklets, reports, printed media tools, 
television, commercials and speeches, the use of websites on Internet could said to be one of 
the most significant communication tools for sharing the mission with the stakeholders. 
Seeing that, companies obviously are well aware of the substantiality of it. However, it is 
necessary to use the mission effectively in order to obtain the positive results. To use the 
mission with utmost effectiveness, the mission statement and all of its elements should be 
placed in the website where it can be easily found and reached, while expressing the mission 
in an understandable language. 

Based on the hypothesis that the websites of the businesses which are acting globally should 
have comparable qualities, as they are trying to reach the same global stakeholders (Pearce & 
Roth, 1998), the objective of this research is to seek an answer to questions such as; if the 
airline companies publish their mission statements on their websites, whether the mission is 
published in an integrated or a sporadic fashion, which category the mission is included in, 
and which page the mission statement is published on. This report uses an exploratory 
research to show whether airline companies use their websites as an effective channel to 
convey their mission statements to their stakeholders and to provide suggestions to boost this 
intention. 

2. The Importance of the Mission Communication through the World Wide Web for 
Airline Companies 

The rapid development in communication technologies and particularly the Internet has 
provided new opportunities for the airline companies. The most prominent opportunity can 
said to be commented in online sales and distribution. Another influence of the Internet and 
other information technologies on airline industries is the rapid increase in self-service 
practices. These allow self-serving reservation, ticketing, and check-in services on a virtual 
platform, which eliminates the involvement of an intermediary. A brand new electronic 
market has emerged for airline companies by means of these new e-trade tools (General 
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Accounting Office [GAO], 2003). Currently, the Internet provides great convenience 
regarding global access with less geographical constraints and local regulatory limits. 
Recently, the Internet has become one of the few media that can overcome cultural restraints 
(Bennett, 1997). Finally, the Internet ensures an alternative setting for intercultural marketing 
in a global market (Hamill, 1997).  

Today, it is inevitable for the airline companies to use the Internet and have an official 
website (Benckendorff, 2006). Airline companies are encouraging their customers to use the 
cost effective online channels and websites instead of their traditional reservation and 
ticketing channels (Lubbe, 2007). Thus, customer relations are brought into prominence 
through the Internet and websites. Companies in the competi1ive business world should 
create long-term relations with their customers and establish sentiments such as trust, loyalty, 
and commitment that would reinforce the perception of enrichment and relations (Harker, 
1999). The Internet and websites are undoubtedly proper means of mass communication in 
customer relations (Chaffey, Mayer, Johnston & Ellis-Chadwick, 2003; Gilbert, Powell-Perry 
& Widijoso, 1999; Peppers & Rogers, 2001; Yelkur & Dacosta, 2001). Official websites are 
important channels that enable the companies to reach their target audience (Robbins & 
Stylianou, 2001-2002)  

Global and multi-component airlines area is an information industry. Even though the 
primary output of the air transportation is flight service, the customers purchase the service 
information before the service itself. Today, as customers’ expectations regarding the product 
and service increase, their demands regarding the information related to the service have 
increased (Kuyucak, 2007). These customer demands also include information about the 
company. Website visitors are more likely to be highly involved and active in terms of 
information acquisition (Chakraborty, Srivastava & Warren, 2005).  

In the airline industry, information is an integrative element, which unites different producers 
and servers from various geographical regions. These differing sides are organized as a 
network and the finished product is formed through information flow, communication and 
service flow (Kuyucak, 2007). Hence, Business-to-Business (B2B) relations are crucial to 
airline companies. In terms of B2B, appearance of the information on an official website is 
even more important due to the financial risks and the complexity of the variations in the 
process regarding the typical B2B proceedings (Peppers & Rogers, 2001).  

Air transportation is a highly outward-oriented industry. Therefore, it is open to ecological, 
social, political and other environmental factors. Within this industry-environment interaction, 
transparency and adequate information distribution is crucial in order to satisfy all parties and 
prevent conflicts (Kuyucak, 2007). 

One of the components forming an airline service delivery is image. The term “image”, 
indicates the overall appearance of the airline company that is established in the minds of the 
customers and the public opinion about the company. Safety is the most important component 
of the image of an airline company (Doganis, 2005). Mission and vision are often the main 
elements that set the public image of a company. External stakeholders are able to get 
familiarized and evaluate the companies using these indications, and they can handle public 
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relations more effectively (Benligiray, Geylan & Duman, 2009). 

Whenever the stakeholders (e.g., personnel, customers, shareholders, suppliers) reach the 
mission statement, they are entitled to consider all or some of the following statements: 1) 
This company is well-managed. Because, in accordance with the current management 
literature, the mission is an important management tool that aims to unite everyone around a 
common philosophy, value system, and objectives (Campbell, 1992; Greengarten-Jackson, 
Yau, Gitlow & Scandura, 1996; Rigby, 1994). Furthermore, a mission statement with 
specified results eliminates the confusion, uncertainty, and conflicts regarding the objectives, 
roles, and tasks of the employees (Fisher, 1983). 2) This company is a focused organization. 
This reassures that the company has a consistent direction (Stolkey, 2004). One of the main 
reasons of the business failure is the inability of the senior management to define the purpose 
of the organization (Bart, 1997). A professionally prepared mission helps the organization 
focus on its primary area of activity and its raison d'etre (Bart & Baetz, 1998). 3) This 
organization wishes to improve its competitive position (Rigby, 1994). Specification of the 
mission increases the companies’ competitiveness (Campbell, 1989, 1993; Campbell & Yeung, 
1991). 4) This organization thinks strategically. Mission is seen as the starting point of almost 
all strategic initiatives (Bart, 1997). 5) This organization is a consistent entity focusing on its 
activities in the long-term. Mission statements are generally deemed important for long-term 
earnings and survival of the company (Pearce, 1982). 6) This company uses contemporary 
administration techniques. As in quality management, restructuring and self-governing groups, 
it is required to determine the mission at the beginning of the contemporary administration 
techniques (Bart, 1997). 7) This organization cares about its stakeholders and tries to unite 
them on a common ground (Klemm et al., 1991). Mission is expected to balance the interests 
and needs of internal and external competitive stakeholders (Bart, 1999). 8) This organization 
uses its resources efficiently. An organization with a determined mission is expected to reflect 
its priorities and the balance set in the mission while allocating resources. Consequently, the 
limited resources of the organization can efficiently be distributed (Bart, 2001). Even the 
possibility of making the stakeholders consider these ideas shows the importance of sharing 
mission statements with the stakeholders of the company.  

3. Visibility of the Mission Statements on the Web 

Today, airline companies use their official websites in order to conduct an extensive 
communication with visitors from various parts of the globe. Due to this extensive utilization, 
it is crucial for the web developers and administrators to create and maintain websites that 
satisfy the user needs. However, it has never been easy for airline companies to find the most 
favorable way of designing an official website that would be considered effective in a 
multicultural environment (Chakraborty et al., 2005). Upon the conducted research, it has 
been suggested that the effectiveness of the website is related to three elements. The first of 
these elements is “content”, which addresses to all of the features offered by the website. 
Useful, correct, up to date and extensive content is the second element, which can also be 
referred as “content quality”. The last element is the “design” of the website, which 
emphasizes the ease of navigation and usage of the website and its qualities of being 
consistent and interesting. The research done on the effectiveness of the websites are 
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generally related to these three elements (e.g., Breitenbach & Van Doren, 1998; Ho, 1997; 
Jeong, Oh & Gregoire, 2003; Murphy, Forrest, Wotring & Brymer, 1996; Perdue, 2001; 
Rachman & Richins, 1997). 

The website visitors demand to find the information they are interested in. The official 
website of an airline company is the introduction of the company as well as an entrance for 
the visitors that would allow them to find critical information (such as mission statements), 
which forms their perception regarding the identity of the company as a whole. If the visitors 
are not able to find helpful and relevant information on the website of a company, they most 
likely tend to adopt a lesser perception regarding the company and visit rival company 
websites which provide the required information and conduct their business with these 
companies (Chakraborty et al., 2005).  

Website visitors should be able to locate the information they are seeking on the website 
easily. When the visitors find the information they seek, they decide to see the next page. In 
the meantime, they need to monitor the page they have already opened. A convenient design 
and navigational assistance (e.g., menus) helps the user to form a mental image regarding the 
organization of information on the website and the information the website offers (Van Berkel 
& de Jong, 1999). For the developers, high quality content development and achieving an 
optimal design regarding the ease of reach to relevant information, and for the users, delays 
on downloading content and the necessity to make multiple hits for a single query might be 
overwhelming (Palmer, 2002).  

Conducted researches address publishing mission statements on the Internet as a common 
practice. Many organizations may utilize their websites as a tool to communicate the mission. 
However, there are still only a handful of guides that would lead the web administrators to 
effective presentations. Very few of the companies know how to use these websites to convey 
information regarding the missions and business strategies to their stakeholders (Bartkus, 
Glassman & Mcafee, 2002).  

It is crucial for the stakeholders of an airline company to be aware of the primary duty, 
business approach, values, and the responsibilities of the company to the stakeholders. 
Stakeholders are able to reach this information (if such information is available) through 
various channels. However, reaching it through websites is far more practical and economical. 
In this case, the website should contain such information in an easily reachable location, 
written in an easily understandable language. In this study, we will seek answers to our 
question because of the reasons stated above. 

4. Design of Study 

The sampling of this research consists of 252 airline companies, 237 of which are IATA 
(International Air Transport Association, whose members cover 93% of the international 
commercial passenger and cargo transportation) members and 100 of which are listed in the 
Top 100 Airline Groups Ranked by Revenues 2009 list published by Airline Business. As 
some companies are present in the both groups, there are a total of 252 companies that are 
examined in the research. 152 companies are only IATA members (60.3%), 15 companies are 
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in the Top 100 list but not members of IATA (6.0%) and 85 companies are both IATA 
members and are on the Top 100 list. 

The websites of the 252 companies in the sampling are examined using content analysis. The 
examination is done by two coders simultaneously and in coordination, and completed with 
cross-checking. The findings are reported with their frequencies and cross-tables. The names 
and website addresses of the companies in the sampling are added in the Appendix-A in 
alphabetical order.  

The first element searched in the websites was the term “mission”, in a link or as a title. If 
this search did not yield any results, mission statement (as a whole or along with its 
components) is searched through the search engine of the website. Since there are no built-in 
site-search systems in some websites and it is possible to overlook some components during 
the analysis, an additional Google search was executed. During this inquiry, the terms, 
“mission, vision, strategy, management philosophy, values and responsibilities” and the name 
of the company are used. 

Finally, the researchers contacted the airline companies that do not have their mission 
statements on their websites. A query e-mail was sent to the webmaster of the company 
particularly to confirm the findings collected from these searches. This e-mail included a 
brief explanation regarding the research. In addition, the e-mail conveyed that no mission 
statements were found in the website and this finding would be reported accordingly in the 
research. A request to contact our research group if they thought the information is 
incomplete or inaccurate was sent to the webmasters. Two companies replied to these queries; 
one of which explained that the company was under complete restructuring, and the latter 
stated that the mission statement was still under discussion.  

The rest of the research is done on the company websites that include a mission statement. 
During the next stage of the research, in which categories the mission statements were 
presented was examined (e.g., home page, about company, corporate info/governance, 
investor/customer relations). If these categories are nested in each other, the category just 
above the mission statements was assumed to be the containing category. When the mission 
statement could be found in a category readily listed in our research template, annual report 
of the company was not analyzed. Corporate info/governance was listed as a category 
providing information regarding the corporate characteristics of the company, and 
corporate/company culture was listed as a category that defines the mission statements within 
the organizational culture of the company and combines this with the philosophy of the 
organization. Code of Ethics/Conduct is also related to the organizational structure, but as this 
document is given as a separate statement and consists of the statutory rules to be adopted by 
the employees, therefore it is considered as a different category.  

The questions asked in the next phase are as follows: Where is the mission statement placed 
within the website? In which page does a visitor will find the mission statement? The location 
of the mission statements is recorded according to the page number of the mission statements. 
A page number was not allocated for the Home Page. Each following “click” was considered 
as another page and the first “click” from the Home Page was considered as page 1 (e.g., 
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Page 0=company home page/a link on the Page 0 was clicked (click 1) and the resulting page 
is Page 1/ a link on the Page 1 was clicked (click 2) and the resulting page is Page 2, etc.).  

Another objective of this study is to detect the number of languages used to convey the 
mission statement. This is the more laborious part of the study, as there are many languages 
being actively used in the world (e.g. Greek, Indian, Persian, German, English, Italian, 
French, Spanish, Russian, Bulgarian, Serbian, Arabic, Hebrew, Chinese, Tibetan, Finnish, 
Hungarian, Turkish, Mongol, Manchu, Tungusic, Korean, Japanese, Ethiopian, Afrikaan etc.) 

While we are familiar with some of these languages, we have encountered some of them for 
the first time. Each language option of all websites were visited individually, and then the 
language that is determined by Google Translate is assumed as true. In some websites, the 
language options are presented both with their English names and their native names. 
However, most sites presented the language options in their native names. When Google 
Translate fails to find the language or the result is doubtful, further research was made about 
the used language. 

The research regarding in which languages the companies present their mission statements 
was started by the page which has the term “mission” in its English correspondent. Then 
other language options were chosen in the said page, the pages are translated with Google 
Translate, and checked if they contain the word, mission. When Google Translate failed to 
translate a language, the location of the mission statement in the English page is found and 
checked whether it’s included in all language options. 

5. Findings 

In this research, the websites of a total of 252 airline companies are analyzed. The sampling 
consists of 16 companies from both the United States and China (People’s Republic of) 
(12.6%), 11 companies from Germany (4.4%), 9 companies from both Russian Federation 
and the United Kingdom, 7 companies from Turkey, 6 companies from South Africa, 5 
companies from France, India and Iran (Islamic Republic of), 4 companies from Israel and 
Italy, 3 companies from Argentina, Australia, Brazil, Ireland, Sweden, Japan, Korea 
(Democratic People’s Republic of), Mexico and Singapore, 2 companies from Austria, 
Bahrain, Belgium, Ecuador, Finland, French Polynesia, Croatia, Hong Kong, Colombia, 
Kuwait, Luxembourg, Malaysia, Norway, Peru, Romania, Chile, Thailand, Tunisia, Ukraine, 
Jordan and Greece and 1 company from Angola, Albania, Azerbaijan, United Arab Emirates 
(UAE), Bangladesh, Belarus, Bosnia and Herzegovina, Brunei Darussalam, Bulgaria, Cape 
Verde, Algeria, China, Chinese Taipei (Taiwan), Czech Republic, Denmark, El Salvador, 
Indonesia, Armenia, Estonia, Ethiopia, Fiji, Philippines, Guam, Georgia, Netherlands, 
Switzerland, Iceland, Montenegro, Qatar, Kazakhstan, Kenya, Cyprus, Costa Rica, Cuba, 
Latvia, Libya, Libyan Arab Jamahiriya, Lebanon, Hungary, Madagascar, Malawi, Malta, 
Mauritius, Egypt, Mongolia, Moldova (Republic of), Morocco, Mozambique, Namibia, 
Nigeria, Pakistan, Panama, Papua New Guinea, Paraguay, Trinidad and Tobago, Poland, 
Réunion, Seychelles, Serbia, Slovenia, Sri Lanka, Sudan, Suriname, Syrian Arab Republic, 
Saudi Arabia, Tanzania (United Republic of), Oman, Uruguay, Vanuatu, Vietnam, Yemen, 
New Caledonia, New Zealand and Zimbabwe. 87 of these companies are from Europe 
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(34.4%), 80 of them are from Asia (31.7%), 28 of them are from Africa (11.1%), 25 of them 
are from North America (8.3%), 21 of them are from South America (8.3%) and 11 of them 
are from Australia (4.4%). 

Out of 252 companies, 174 (69.1%) included their mission statements explicitly or implicitly 
to their websites, while 78 (31.0%) of them did not have a statement regarding their mission. 
150 (86.2%) of the 177 companies presented their mission statements at their own websites, 
while 24 of them (13.8%) presented the mission statement at the websites of the holdings 
they are affiliated with. While the mission statements of 101 (58.0%) companies were 
presented as a whole, mission statements of 73 (42.0%) companies were spread to the 
different pages of their websites. Among the companies which presented their mission 
statements non-fragmented in their websites, the mission statements were placed under the 
title “Our Mission” by 86 (49.4%) companies, while 15 (8.6%) companies placed it under the 
“Mission” link. 

Table 1 displays the relationship between the continent in which the company resides and the 
tendency of the company to publish their mission statement at their websites. 24 (30.8%) of 
the European airline companies, 26 (33.3%) of the Asian companies, 11 (31.0%) of the 
African companies, 9 of the North American companies, 1 of the South American companies 
and 7 of the Australian companies didn’t publish the mission statement at their websites. 63 
(36.2%) of the companies which publish their mission statement at their websites are 
European, 54 (31.0%) are Asian, 20 (11.5%) are South American, 17 (9.8%) are African, 16 
(92.%) are North American and 4 (2.3%) are Australian (see Table 1). 

72 (30.4%) of the 237 companies which are members of IATA and 21 (21.0%) of the (Airline 
Business’ list of) Top 100 companies have no information regarding their mission statements 
on their websites. 95 (54.6%) companies out of 174 are only members of IATA, 9 (5.2%) are 
only on the Top 100 list, and 70 (40.2%) are both IATA members and are on the Top 100 list 
(see Table 1). 

173 (99.4%) of the companies which publish their mission statements on their websites had 
an English website. The one company that did not was Air Madagascar. 77 (44.3%) 
companies had German, 75 (43.1%) had French, 73 (42.0%) had Spanish, 56 (32.2%) had 
Italian, 50 (28.7%) had Russian, 47 (27.0%) had Chinese, 46 (26.4%) had Portuguese, 36 
(20.7%) had Japanese and 30 (17.2%) had Korean language options on their websites. 77 
(44.3%) companies had one or more of the following language options: Dutch, Turkish, 
Polish, Swedish, Danish, Norwegian, Arabic, Hungarian, Greek, Czech, Thai, Finnish, 
Romanian, Slovak, Bulgarian, Estonian, Hebrew, Slovenian, Catalan, Vietnamese, Croatian, 
Ukrainian, Serbian, Latvian, Persian, Lithuanian, Indonesian, Kazakh, Malay, Albanian, 
Macedonian, Armenian, Swahili and Afrikaans. 

18 (10.3%) of the airline companies had no language options. While the website of the Air 
Madagascar was French, the websites of the other companies were in English. 58 (33.3%) 
companies had two language options, 18 (10.3%) had three, 12 (6.9%) had four, 10 (5.7%) 
had five, 12 (6.9%) had six, 7 (4.0%) had seven, 5 (2.9%) had eight, 7 (4.0%) had nine and 
27 (15.5%) had ten or more language options available on their websites. It has been noticed 
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that the airline companies in cargo business had more language options on their websites. 5 of 
the companies that had more than 10 language options on their websites were airline cargo 
companies. DHL Air and DHL International had 33, TNT Airways had 30, UPS (United 
Parcel Service) Airlines- had 22 and FedEx (Federal Express) had 20 language options on 
their websites. 

49 airline companies published their mission statements in one language, 71 did in two, 14 
did in three, 8 did in four, 7 did in five, 6 did in six, 4 did in seven, 3 did in eight, 3 did in 
nine and 9 did in ten or more languages. TNT Airways had 29 and UPS Airlines had 22 
language options for their mission statements. Table 2 demonstrates the relationship between 
the language options for the websites and the language options for the mission statements.  

 

Table 1. The relationship between the continental location of the airline companies and the 
presence of the mission statements on their websites 

 

163 (93.7%) companies declared their mission statements in English, 39 (22.4%) in French 
38 (21.8%) in German, 39 (22.4%) in Spanish, 32 (18.4%) in Russian, 27 (15.5%) in Italian, 
24 (13.8%) in Portuguese and 23 (13.2%) in Chinese. As an addition, the 62 (35.6%) airline 
companies in the “Others” category had one or more language options among the following 
for the mission statement: Japanese, Korean, Dutch, Turkish, Polish, Swedish, Danish, 
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Norwegian, Arabic, Hungarian, Greek, Czech, Thai, Finnish, Romanian, Slovak, Bulgarian, 
Estonian, Hebrew, Slovenian, Catalan, Vietnamese, Croatian, Ukrainian, Serbian, Latvian, 
Persian, Lithuanian, Indonesian, Kazakh, Malay, Albanian, Macedonian, Armenian, Swahili 
and Afrikaans. 

 

Table 2. The relationship between the numbers of language options for websites and mission 
statements of the airline companies 

 

Table 3 demonstrates the relationship between the place of the mission statement on the 
website and the number of language options provided for it. 33 (32.7%) of the companies 
which placed the mission statement under “Our Mission” title or in the “Mission” link had no 
language options (statements were given in English), 39 (38.6%) had two (generally the 
native language and English) and 6 (5.9%) had three. Among the company websites which 
gave the mission statement implicitly, 16 (21.9%) websites gave this information in one 
language, 32 (43.8%) gave it in two languages and 8 (11.0%) gave it in three languages. 

While doing the research on the location of the mission statement on the websites, it has been 
seen that only euroAtlantic Airways had their mission statement located on the homepage of 
their website. The mission statement was on the first page of the websites of 49 (28.2%) 
companies, on the second page of the websites of 68 (39.1%) companies, on the third page of 
the websites of 42 (24.1%) companies, on the fourth page of the websites of 11 (6.3%) 
companies and on the fifth page of the websites of 2 companies (Corsair and LAN Airlines). 
See Table 4 to examine the relationship between the page number of the mission statement 
and the language options offered for the mission statement. 
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Table 3. The relationship between the location of the mission statement on the website and the 
number of language options provided 

 

 

Table 4. The relationship between the page number of the mission statement on the website and 
the number of language options provided 
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As seen on Table 4, the company which placed its mission statement at the homepage also 
gave more than ten (eleven) language options. While 12 (24.0%) of the companies which put 
their mission statement on the first page did not give language options, 19 (38.0%) companies 
gave two and 18 (36.7%) companies gave three or more language options. 15 (22.0%) of the 
companies which put their mission statement on the second page did not give language 
options, 31 (46.0%) companies gave two and 22 (32.3%) companies gave three or more 
language options. 16 (39.0%) of the companies which put their mission statement on the third 
page did not give language options, 11 (27.0%) companies gave two and 14 companies gave 
three or more language options. It has also been seen that the companies which located their 
mission statements on the further pages gave three language languages at most (see Table 4). 

The research on the categories in which the mission statements were placed under is as 
follows: The mission statements were under “About Company” for 114 (65.5%) websites, 
under “Corporate Governance/Info” for 26 (14.9%), under “Annual Report” for 12 (6.9%), 
under “Policy/Strategy” for 7 (4.0%), under “Code of Ethics/Conduct” for 5 (2.9%), under 
“Investor/Customer Relations” for 5, under “Corporate/Company Culture” for 4 (2.3%). 

Table 5 displays the relationship between the location of the mission statement on the website, 
the category which the mission statement falls under and the number of language options 
provided for the mission statement.  Under  “Annual Report” (5 websites one, 7 

 

Table 5. The relationship between the location of the mission statement on the website, the 
category which the mission statement falls under and the number of language options provided 
for the mission statement 
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websites two languages), “Investor/Customer Relations” (4 websites one, 1 website two 
languages) and “Corporate/Company Culture” (2 websites one, 2 websites two languages) 
categories, the mission statements were given in one or two languages, while under 
“Policy/Strategy” and “Code of Ethics/Conduct” categories, the statements were given in 
three languages. The most amount of language options were given when the mission 
statement is under the category, “About Company”. While 83 companies displayed their 
mission statements with three of fewer languages, 31 companies displayed it with four or 
more languages. 

6. Discussion and Conclusion 

The Internet can provide a cost-efficient gateway that would ensure global corporate 
communication for most organizations including small and medium-sized enterprises (Hamill, 
1997). The result of our research which explores if the business operators use these gateways 
as a channel to inform their stakeholders about their missions was rather positive. 
Approximately 70% of the 252 airline companies included in the sampling published their 
mission statements on their official websites. However, only 40% percent of these companies 
gave their mission statements under the “Our Mission” title or link as a whole. 

At the part of our research where the relationship between the continental locations of the 
companies and whether the companies announce their missions at their websites is examined, 
we have seen that all companies in South America apart from one included their mission 
statements to their websites. About a quarter of the African, North American, Asian and 
European companies, and more than half of the Australian airline companies did not give 
their mission statements on their websites. South American companies have the most 
percentage of giving the mission statement explicitly. The other continents follow in 
descending order as Africa, North America, Asia, Australia and Europe. It is possible to use 
some assumptions to explain this difference. The first possibility is the “follow-the-leader 
approach” regarding the organizational paradigm (Meyer & Rowan, 1977). The companies 
from the same continent may be mimicking each other while designing websites. The second 
possibility is the belief that the mission statements are more of an internal communications 
tool rather than an external one (Leuthesser & Kohli, 1997). The change in the existence and 
presentation of the mission statements on the company websites according to geographical 
locations may be attributed to changes in culture, management styles, governmental 
mechanisms and the power of the stakeholders (Culpan & Kucukemiroglu, 1993; Knight & 
Pretty, 2001). These factors may differentiate the European, Japanese and American 
companies’ willingness to share their mission statements (Bartkus et al., 2002). 

Most airline companies working globally have to prepare their websites in a language for the 
stakeholders to be able to understand. The result of this research indicates that most of the 
companies give English and the native language as the language options of the website. Most 
companies who give two language options for the website also provide their mission 
statement in those two languages. This situation which we attribute to English being accepted 
as the language of global communication is not acceptable. It is attention grabbing how 
companies publish their mission statements in so few languages although they have many 
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stakeholders globally and multicultural. For example, DHL Air and DHL International which 
gives 33 language options and FedEx (Federal Express) which gives 20 language options for 
their websites, publish their mission statements only in English. Nevertheless, there are 
companies which have the necessary resources and are aware of the importance of 
announcing the mission statement, and these companies give more than 10 language options 
for both their websites and their mission statements. These companies are Air Berlin, Air 
China, Cathay Pacific Airways, Dragonair, Etihad Airways, euroAtlantic Airways, THY – 
Turkish Airlines, TNT Airways and UPS Airlines – United Parcel Service. 

The mission can be composed of various components. Considering airline companies, these 
components can be organizational goals, values, beliefs, philosophy, self-concept, desired 
public image, distinguishing qualities/unique identity, job description, vision, strategy 
(competition, price, corporate or general), responsibilities to various stakeholders 
(shareholders, employees/managers, customers, suppliers, public, state/regulatory authorities), 
offered products or services, geographical service area, technological highlights 
(flight-reservation or ticket sales), quality and innovation highlights, safety/security 
highlights, environmental impact). When a mission statement is published, it is essential to 
unite the ideas that the company wishes to convey as a whole so that the visitor would not 
have to go through different pages of the website in order to integrate the partial information 
regarding the mission. It is deemed positive that out of the 252 airline company websites, 
32% placed the mission statement under “Our Mission” title, while 6% gave a “Mission/Our 
Mission” link. Such navigational assistance provides the visitors a mental image that 
illustrates how the information is organized and what information are available (Van Berkel 
& De Jong, 1999). While about half of the companies shared their mission statements as an 
integrated title, the other half spread this information throughout the website under various 
titles (Our Vision, Our Values, Our Strategy, Management Philosophy, or Responsibilities) 
and locations.  

Homepage of a website is rather important. The most important information regarding the 
company is published on the homepage. Of 252 airline companies, only one of them shared 
its mission statement as a whole on the homepage. 19.4% of these companies placed their 
mission statements on the first page, while 26.9% placed them on the second page, 16.6% on 
the third page, and 4.4% on the fourth page. In other words, the most frequent pages in which 
the mission statements are located on are the second, first, third, fourth pages and the 
homepage, in this particular order. In Bart’s research (2001), which is similar to our research, 
the percentage of the websites publishing mission statements was 45. In this study, the most 
common locations for the mission statements are the second page (19%), third page (11%), 
fourth (or more) page (7%), first page (4%) and homepage (2%). Both our studies and Bart’s 
research showed that the companies often place their mission statement on the second or third 
page of the website. 

Distinctive from the plain text reader, the Internet user chooses a page in which the 
information is separated into, and sees the pages one at a time. In the contrary, plain text is 
linear, and the reader does not need to choose. Because of this, reading a nonlinear text on a 
website may be more difficult than reading plain text. Visitors should be able to find the 



Journal of Management Research 
ISSN 1941-899X 

2013, Vol. 5, No. 1 

www.macrothink.org/jmr 55

related information on the website with ease. When the visitors find the information they 
were looking for, they choose to see the next page. In the meantime, they need to continue to 
follow the current page (Van Berkel & De Jong, 1999). In this case, it can be said that it is a 
small possibility for the visitors to see the mission statements on the company websites. 

Mission, as a category, is important information for the company. It defines why a company 
was found, what its main purpose is, which philosophy, approach and values it uses while 
accomplishing this purpose and where it wants to see itself in the far future. That is the reason 
why it should be in the category, “About Company”. Nearly half of the companies in our 
sampling (45%) placed their mission statement under the category “About Company”. 
Secondly, the mission is an organizational public statement. About 10% of the companies 
most probably considered this, and placed the mission under “Corporate Info/Governance”, 
and 5% placed it under “Annual Report”. Mission statements are tools of politics and strategy. 
Assuming some companies interpreted the mission accordingly thus placed it under 
“Policy/Strategy” section. The mission statement is closely related to organizational culture 
and values. 2% of the companies placed the mission under “Ethics/Conduct” and 2% placed 
it under “Corporate/Company Culture”, regarding this outlook. Among the companies in the 
sampling, only 3% placed the mission under a category which is directly related to 
stakeholders, which is “Investor/Customer Relations”. 

It is possible to deduce that a multilingual mission statement indicates a good understanding 
of the importance of the mission statement and the desire to reach global stakeholders. This 
deduction would lead to the prediction that the companies which give more than 10 language 
options for their mission statements would place the mission statement in the first two pages, 
under the mission link or “About Company” category. In our sampling, out of the companies 
who gave more than 10 language options for the mission statement, one placed it on the 
homepage, four placed it on the first page, three placed it on the second page and one placed 
it on the third page. Only five of these companies presented their mission statements as a 
whole. The mission statement was under “Our Mission” title in four companies’ websites, 
under a separate link in another website, while four websites gave it without labeling it as the 
mission. Among these websites, one placed the mission statement on the home page, seven 
placed it under the category, “About Company”, and one placed it under “Corporate 
Governance/Info”. Air China, which is an Asian company, a member of IATA and also on the 
Top 100 list, gave the mission statement on the first page, under “About Company” category, 
under a separate link and as a whole. 

In conclusion, the majority of the airline companies in our sampling use their websites to 
announce their mission statements, which is found positive. However, we believe that the 
websites are not being used to full effect in conveying the mission statements to the 
stakeholders. We should emphasize again that, to be effective, the websites and mission 
statements should be prepared in multiple languages, the mission statements should be placed 
under a separate link or title, should be placed on the homepage or on the first page, under the 
categories “About Company” and “About Us”. 
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7. Limitations and future research  

This research is done on the websites of airline companies. Websites are generally dynamic 
due to constant updates. Because of this, the findings of this research should be evaluated 
regarding the date of the research. The websites in the sampling were examined between 
February 23rd and April 28th, 2011, and the research has been updated and revised between 
July 26th and August 24th, 2011. When doing a research on many companies, in spite of 
exceptional care, it is not simple to assure absolute standardization. For example, we counted 
the number or “clicks” to reach the mission statement from homepage. We assumed the title 
the mission statement was written under as the category. Generally, “Our Mission” link 
showed up when “About Company” or “About Us” links were clicked. In this case, we 
assumed the category as “About Company”. Some gave the statement under “Annual Report”, 
which is under “Investor Relations”. In this case, we assumed the category as “Annual 
Report”. During our research, we chose the category closest to the mission statement as the 
category. 

In this research, the efficiency of the announcement of the mission statement is measured by 
the ease of locating and reaching it on the website. We believe that the information offered in 
this study is of importance to airline company executives and web designers. As a 
continuation of this study, we are analyzing the contents of the mission statements. By this 
approach, we will clarify if the airline companies announce their mission statements 
efficiently on their websites, and what elements do they include as content. 

We believe that it is important to get consults from the stakeholders regarding the location 
and content of the mission statement on the website. While there are some studies regarding 
industrial and local companies, there are none about stakeholders of global airline companies. 
Furthermore, the alteration in a stakeholder’s perception of the company after reading the 
mission statement, its direction and form and whether it affects buying behavior are among 
the topics that should be further researched. 
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B2B : Business-to-Business 

DHL : Adrian Dalsey, Larry Hillblom, Robert Lynn 

FedEx : Federal Express 

GAO : General Accounting Office 

IATA : International Air Transport Association 

TNT : Thomas Nationwide Transport 

THY : Turkish Airlines 

UPS : United Parcel Service 
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