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Abstract 

The existing literature has acknowledged the complicated links among external business 
environments, corporate governance and organisational performance. However, a large void 
exists in the extant research models of corporate governance, because none have discussed 
and empirically examined the intervenient effect of the corporate governance mechanism on 
the external business environments and organisational performance. A thorough review of the 
literature on corporate governance, external business environments and organisational 
performance comes to the proposed hypotheses. The indirect effect of external business 
environments on organisational performance via corporate governance is statistically tested. 
The research provides empirical evidence that organisational performance is the consequence 
of both corporate governance and external business environments that is, in turn, the causality 
of corporate governance. More importantly, it offers insight into the mediating effect of 
corporate governance in transforming the uncertainty of external business environments into 
organisational performance. The findings suggest that firms facing uncertainty in external 
business environments should adopt suitable corporate governance to achieve the best 
organisational performance. 
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1. Introduction 

The fall of WorldCom (in 2002) and Enron (in 2001) in the United States has drawn scholarly 
attention to corporate governance research (Altunoglu 2012). These scandals have also 
triggered the adoption of good corporate governance within firms, especially those that are 
publicly listed (James and Joseph 2015). Research on corporate governance has been 
traditionally grounded in agency theory, which explicates the interplays of principals (owners) 
with agents (managers) and agent-principal problems resulting from conflicts between the 
owners and managers in term of interests (Eisenhardt 1989). The agency theory emphasises 
the role of corporate governance as an instrument to lessen agency conflicts between the 
shareholders and the executives running their firms. Hence, it can enhance organisational 
competitive advantages and gain sustainable improved performance (Fooladi and Chaleshtori 
2011). 

Several corporate governance academics have revealed that agency theory has become 
governing in the code of corporate governance practices due to its contribution to 
management knowledge and practice and policy implementation (Lan and Heracleous 2010; 
Shleifer and Vishny 1997). Following Lan and Heracleous (2010), almost all experiential 
research has attempted to comprehend the mechanism of corporate governance by employing 
the agency theory to examine relationships between the mechanism of corporate governance 
and organisational effectiveness. Nevertheless, Aguilera et al. (2008) argues that agency 
theory has been censured for its viewpoint of the closed system of organisation, establishing a 
general set of links between corporate governance mechanisms and organisational 
performance, without paying much attention to the organisation’s contextual conditions. This 
will affect the agency theory’s ability to correctly explain suitable corporate governance 
mechanisms across different external business environments (Aguilera et al. 2008; Aguilera 
and Jackson 2003). 

Conversely, the contingency theory supports the approach of an open organisation and 
declines the perspective of the general best mechanisms advocated by the agency theory 
(Donaldson 2001). The core of the contingency theory advocates that different corporate 
governance practices can be more or less efficient in diverse business environments (Aguilera 
et al. 2008; Scott 2003), conditional upon numerous contextual factors (e.g., external business 
environments (Otley 1980)). Scholars have drawn on the agency theory to emphasise the 
importance of a sound corporate governance mechanism in enhancing organisational 
performance (Aguilera et al. 2008; Aguilera and Jackson 2003). Other academics have relied 
on the contingency theory to recommend that organisational effectiveness stems from the 
matching between organisational characteristics (e.g. corporate governance practices) and 
contextual contingencies (e.g. external business environments) facing the organisation 
(Donaldson 2001; Ezzamel and Hart 1987). 

Implied from the contingency theory, the mechanism of corporate governance plays a role as 
a mediator in transmitting the effect of external business environments into organisational 
performance (Donaldson 2001; Aguilera et al. 2008; Scott 2003; Ezzamel and Hart 1987). 
Furthermore, for Margolis and Walsh (2003), it is necessary to develop research models 
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which integrate contextual conditions and organisational variables, and test mediating 
mechanisms often ignored, as well as set up the causal relationships among the environmental 
contexts, organisational variables and organisational performance. Therefore, this research 
takes into account the potential for a mediating influence to more broadly explore the 
contribution of corporate governance and external business environments to organisational 
effectiveness. For this objective, this article makes an imperative contribution to the 
hypothetical advancement of the external business environments - corporate governance - 
firm performance linkage suggested by Elghrabawy (2012). This study joins agency problems 
with contingencies and an institutional perspective to conjecture a hypothetical model of the 
dynamics of corporate governance and organisational performance (Figure 1) and investigate 
the extent to which the influence of external business environments on organisational 
performance is mediated by corporate governance mechanisms. 

 

Figure 1. The link among corporate governance, external business environments and 
organisational performance. 

To the best of the researcher’s knowledge, this paper is the first to study the mediation of the 
corporate governance mechanism on the impact of external business environments on 
organisational performance. The findings are expected to provide researchers and executives 
with new insight into the complex research model of corporate governance. The findings are 
expected to be helpful to business directors of firms in making better decisions on the 
application of suitable corporate governance for their external business environments, so as to 
best improve organisational effectiveness. 

2. Conceptual developments and hypotheses 

All business organisations, which are open systems connected to their external business 
environments, aim to achieve their best organisational performance by wisely using resources 
to obtain profits (Scott 2001). Organisational performance is the actual outcome of a firm that 
is evaluated in terms of non-financial and financial indicators (Hudson et al. 2001; Droge et 
al. 2003). Anchored in agency theory, this article establishes the role of the corporate 
governance mechanism in boosting firm performance, based on Aguilera et al. (2008) and 
Aguilera and Jackson (2003). It is based on the contingency theory to recommend that the 
best organisational performance originates from the fitting between the corporate governance 
mechanism and its external business environments (Donaldson 2001). The contingency 
theory mentions firm performance, when discussing the effects of externally environmental 
variables on organisational variables. However, this theory cannot clearly explain the 
interdependence between external business environments and organisational performance 
(Volberda et al. 2012). On the contrary, institutional theory focusing on a firm’s relationship 
with its external business environments asserts that the organisational effectiveness, in part, 
depends on the external business environments (Scott 2001; Zucker 1987). 
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Grounded in agency theory, Bhagat and Bolton (2008) discover a positive correlation 
between corporate governance and organisational performance. Research on the role of 
managerial boards highlights that an individual taking charge of the chief executive officer, 
together with the chairman, often pursues their own benefit at the expense of other 
stakeholders. However, if the chief executive officers hold a large number of their firm’s 
stocks, then their benefits are in agreement with other shareholders (White and Ingrassia 
1992). Therefore, they would act in n ways that benefit the firm. Furthermore, organisations 
with managerial boards composed of independent directors in a majority will counteract 
agency problems, because these managerial boards could oversee the self-interested actions 
taken by executives, which  alleviates the agency problems, and leads to a more enhanced 
organisational performance (Kaymak and Bektas 2008; Nicholson and Kiel 2007).  

Independent executives are generally recruited for their excellent qualifications, knowledge 
and experience. In this way, they may make more efficient business decisions. At the same 
standpoint, Bebenroth and Donghao (2007) underline the important supervisory role of the 
independent executives, which is to reduce the agency costs enhancing the organisational 
performance. This means that a firm can undergo poorer performance, if its managerial 
boards cannot supervise the underperforming directors. In addition, several previous studies 
suggest that a good mechanism of corporate governance will promote the creation of good 
organisational performance (Ljubojevic et al. 2013; Zabri et al. 2016; Bualla et al. 2017). 

Drawing on the contingency theory, Soltani (2005) examines the factors affecting corporate 
governance and identifies a positive relationship between a firm’s existing corporate 
governance and its external business environments. Duncan (1972) relates external business 
environments to suppliers, customers or clients, competitors, technologies and social-political 
issues. Heinrich et al. (2007) proposes four elements of external business environments: 1. 
contingent factors related to being under pressure from outside minority shareholders, 2. 
pressure from majority shareholders, 3. pressure from state legal regulations, and 4. pressure 
from globalization. Heinrich et al. (2007) then emphasise that these elements likely drive 
corporate governance.  

The importance of external business environments in structuring corporate governance is 
confirmed in Altunoglu (2012), where the uncertainty of external business environments will 
force executives to build appropriate corporate governance mechanisms to deal with the 
changing situation for survival. For Aguilera et al. (2008) and Afolabi (2015), external 
business environments are imperative to a firm’s corporate governance mechanism in which 
high environmental uncertainty requires managers to build a sound corporate governance 
mechanism. 

Volberda et al. (2012) adhere to the institutional perspective to explore the dependence of 
organisational behaviour on organisational context. These academics highlight that numerous 
facets of firms are driven by the desire to attain the fit with their external business 
environments. Institutional fit improves organisational performance through diverse 
managerial mechanisms (e.g., corporate governance (Levitt and March 1988)). Other research 
has discussed and examined the effect of external business environments on organisational 
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performance. Choe (2003) suggests external business environments as a causation of 
organisational performance. Additionally, Adeoye and Elegunde (2012) explore the causal 
links between external business environments and organisational performance, verifying that 
external business environments impose a significant effect on organisational performance.  

Given the interaction between organisations and their external business environments, the 
business organisations try to understand, react and impact external business environment 
changes to obtain the best possible organisational performance (Adeoye and Elegunde 2012). 
Similarly, drawing on Mia and Clarke (1999), organisational performance is expected to be 
improved in a highly competitive business environment. Furthermore, when external business 
environments are progressively uncertain, executives often pay more attention to their 
business activities, which would result in improved organisational performance (Ajibolade et 
al. 2010). Moreover, the specific external business environments facing an organisation could 
make an essential contribution to the organisational competitive capability and organisational 
performance (Vo 2015; Ibrahim and Primiana 2015; Pratistha 2016; Kuznetsova et al. 2017). 
The interdependence between external business environments and organisational 
performance is also examined by Abdallah and Persson (2014), who argue that an 
organisation facing high environmental uncertainty needs to fit itself to the environmental 
change to improve its organisational performance. 

For the role of corporate governance, Volberda et al. (2012) incorporate institutional and 
contingency perspectives to propose that an organisation needs to match its corporate 
governance with external business environments to achieve superior performance. This 
means that an appropriate mechanism of corporate governance depends on external business 
environments to attempt to obtain greater organisational performance. The previously 
discussed reasoning leads to a mediating mechanism in which external business environments 
will increase their organisational performance through a good mechanism of corporate 
governance. 

Consequently, four hypotheses can be developed:  

(1) Hypothesis 1: Higher uncertainty of external business environments can lead to better 
organisational performance;  

(2) Hypothesis 2: Good corporate governance can bring about superior organisational 
performance;  

(3) Hypothesis 3: Higher uncertainty of external business environments is positively 
related to better corporate governance; and  

(4) Hypothesis 4: Corporate governance can mediate the causal link from external 
business environments to organisational performance 

3. Research methodology 

Data was collected from executives involved in corporate governance (one executive for each 
selected firm). Each executive was asked to fill out a survey. The research population was 
composed of all 1142 public firms listed on the Vietnamese Stock Exchanges in the first 
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quarter of 2017. Vietnam was selected, because it is the most rapidly growing and emerging 
market in Asia and little attention to Vietnamese corporate governance has been paid (Ahmad 
et al. 2003; Vo 2015). A simple random sampling was employed to gather the data. 

The 400 executives of the randomly selected firms were interviewed in person with the 
questionnaires based on the following constructs (Hair et al. 2009). Surveys without essential 
adequate information were deleted from the database. Overall, there were 349 usable 
responses. External business environments (EBE) were judged on five elements: 1) 
Governmental policies-EBE1, 2) Economy-EBE2, 3) Resources and services used by the 
firm-EBE3, 4) Product market and demand-EBE4, and 5) Competition-EBE5 (Miller 1993; 
Brouthers et al. 2002). These elements were measured on a five level scale: always forecasted, 
easily forecasted, a little hard to be forecasted, quite hard to be forecasted and very hard to be 
forecasted (Chenhall and Morris 1986). 

Organisational Performance (OPE) is assessed on five items: 1) Innovativeness-OPE1, 2) 
Quality in products or services-OPE2, 3) Customer satisfaction-OPE3 (nonfinancial), 4) 
Return on assets-OPE4, and 5) Return on equity-OPE5 (financial) (Hudson et al. 2001; Droge 
et al. 2003). A comparison of the industry-average for the items with a five-point scale from 
no growth, a little growth, average growth, fast growth and very fast growth, during the last 
three years, was made. Corporate Governance (CGO) refers to the proportion of independent 
directors-CGO1, the proportion of independent supervisors-CGO2 and the proportion of the 
firm's stock owned by the chief executive officer-CGO3 (Bhagat and Bolton 2008). 

This research uses path analyses to explore the causal relationships among external business 
environments, corporate governance and organisational performance. Path analysis is an 
expansion of multiple regressions applied to simultaneously examine a set of causal 
relationships. It is also employed to inspect the mediation of one variable on the causal links 
among the other variables (Hair et al. 2009). This research applies path analyses, because the 
method of maximum likelihood used in the path analyses takes into consideration the 
potential correlations amongst disturbances, which is robust to abnormality and 
misspecification (Olsson et al. 2000). It then employs the mediating analytic technique to test 
the statistical significance for the intermediary effect of corporate governance by using the 
methods advocated by Baron and Kenny (1986) and Spencer (2011). The indirect influence 
by mediation is tested with a t-test, in which the t-statistic is calculated as a ratio of the 
indirect estimate to its standard error. 

4. Empirical findings 

After the data was collected and cleaned, a confirmatory factor analysis was conducted to test 
the factor structure of the set of measured variables. This analysis tests how well the observed 
variables represent their underlying latent factors or how well the data fits the theorised 
measurement model. The statistical indices used to assess the goodness of fit of the theorised 
measurement model are presented in Table 1. 

The figures in Table 1 convey the information on the goodness of fit for the theoretical 
measurement model. The Χ2/df value of 1.964 is smaller than 2, indicating an acceptable fit 
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of the theoretical model with the analysed data (Byrne 1991). RMSEA is the index of the 
Root Mean Square Error of Approximation, obtaining the value of 0.053, which is lower than 
the recommended threshold of 0.06 (Hu and Bentler 1999). The IFI (Incremental fit index) 
was 0.966, the TLI (Tucker-Lewis coefficient) was 0.956, the CFI (Comparative fit index) 
was 0.965 and the GFI (Goodness of fit index) was 0.949. All of these values were larger 
than 0.9, the smallest cutoff value suggested by Hair et al. (2009). On the whole, these 
indicators demonstrate a good fit of the theoretical model to the sample data. 

Table 1. Goodness of fit indices 
Fit Index Χ2/df RMSEA IFI TLI CFI GFI 

Value 1.964 0.053 0.966 0.956 0.965 0.949 
Results Good Good Good Good Good Good 

The statistics for the construct validity and reliability of the theoretical model are illustrated 
in Tables 2 and 3, stipulated by Hair et al. (2009). The factor loading is simply the correlation 
between each measured variable and its latent construct. Hence, it represents the relationship 
of the latent construct with each measured variable. The average variance extracted (AVE) is 
a summary measure of convergence among a set of measured variables representing a latent 
construct and computed on the average percent of variance in the latent construct explained 
among the measured variables. The construct reliability (CR) is a measure of the overall 
reliability of a set of heterogeneous, but similar, measured variables. The CR for each factor 
could be achieved by the sum of the squared standardised factor loadings divided by the total 
of that sum and the sum of the error variances for the measured variables of the factor. 

Table 2. Measurement model results 
Observed variables Constructs Factor Loading 

EBE1 

External Business environment (EBE) 

0.762*** 
EBE2 0.715*** 
EBE3 0.685*** 
EBE4 0.684*** 
EBE5 0.708*** 
CGO1 

Corporate governance (CGO) 
0.702*** 

CGO2 0.679*** 
CGO3 0.772*** 
OPE1 

Organizational performance (OPE)  

0.765*** 
OPE2 0.645*** 
OPE3 0.753*** 
OPE4 0.704*** 
OPE5 0.688*** 

***Significance at the 1% level 

The factor loadings of the three main constructs in Table 2, ranging from 0.645 to 0.772, are 
over 0.5, the acceptable cutoff value proposed by Hair et al. (2009). The relationship from the 
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latent construct “OPE” to item “OPE2” is the lowest, at 0.645. The correlation between the 
latent factor “CGO” and indicator “CGO3” was 0.772, the highest value. All factor loadings 
achieve statistical significance at the 1% level. The findings are acceptable, because the high 
correlations between the latent factor and its indicators demonstrate high reliability. 

Table 3 illustrates the AVEs, varying from 0.506 to 0.517, where numbers greater than 0.5 
are acceptable. In addition, all three CRs obtain values greater than the acceptable threshold 
of 0.7 (ranging from 0.762 to 0.838) (see Table 3). As such, the high estimates illustrate the 
high reliability of the constructs. Consequently, it can be concluded that a set of measured 
variables reflect their theorised latent construct. The theoretical measurement model achieves 
adequate convergent validity. Table 3 also offers support for discriminant validity. That is, all 
the AVEs are bigger than their corresponding SICs. This result indicates that the observed 
items have more in common with their factors than they do with the other factors. 

To test whether the problem of multicollinearity occurs within the sample data, Kennedy 
(1992) suggests that an acceptable level of inter-construct correlation (IC) should not be 
larger than the 0.8 cutoff. The ICs in Table 3 range from 0.407 to 0.707. Hence, 
multicollinearity does not exist for the dataset. In addition, the bootstrapping technique, a 
non-parametric method relying on random sampling with replacement for 1,000 times, is 
used to assess the accuracy of the measurement model (Efron 1988). This research estimates 
all loadings and related bootstrapping t-critical ratios through 1000 bootstrapping runs. All 
the indices in the measurement model obtain the values of the bootstrapping t-critical as 
above 1.96 (un-tabulated), the lowest value suggested by Hulland (1999). This demonstrates 
a highly adequate reliability of the statistical estimates in the measurement model. These 
results collectively offer adequate validity of the measurement model with the analysed data. 

Table 3. Matrix of IC, AVE, CR and SIC 
 EBE CGO OPE 

EBE  0.174 0.166 
CGO 0.417  0.499 
OPE 0.407 0.707  
AVE 0.506 0.517 0.510 
CR 0.836 0.762 0.838 

Values below the diagonal are CRs, AVEs and ICs (inter-construct correlations) 
Values above the diagonal are SICs (squared inter-construct correlations) 

In regard to the causal links in the research model, the results are outlined in Figures 1 and 2. 
The findings of the path analyses offer statistically empirical support for Hypotheses 1 
through 3. Both Figures 1 and 2 indicate that the uncertainty of the external business 
environments positively influences the organisational performance, with β=0.33 (Figure 2) 
and β=0.15 (Figure 3), at a significance level of 1%. Furthermore, Figure 3 demonstrates that 
the uncertainty of the external business environments and corporate governance are both 
positively related to the organisational performance, in that corporate governance (β=0.54) is 
stronger than the uncertainty of external business environments (β=0.15) in improving the 
organisational performance. 
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Figure 2. Path diagram denoting the causal relationship 
(***Significance at the 1% level) 

The models achieve an adequate goodness of fit at a significance level of 1%. The uncertainty 
of the external business environments alone statistically explains 12% of the variation in the 
organisational performance at a statistical significance level of 1% (Figure 2). The 
uncertainty of the external business environments and the corporate governance explain 38% 
of the variation in the organisational performance (Figure 3). These findings empirically 
support Hypotheses 1 and 2. In addition, the statistics in Figure 3 empirically support the 
causal link from the uncertainty of external business environments to corporate governance 
with an affecting coefficient of 0.33 at a statistical significance level of 1%. The uncertainty 
of external business environments alone accounts for 11% of the variance in corporate 
governance, supporting Hypothesis 1. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Figure 3. Path diagram denoting the theorized causal models 
(***Significance at the 1% level) 

Overall, the path diagram in Figure 2 shows that the uncertainty of the external business 
environments alone affects organisational performance at a statistical significance of 1%. The 
addition of corporate governance into the research model results in a decrease in the affecting 
magnitude of external business environments uncertainty on organisational performance from 
0.33 (in Figure 2) to 0.15 (in Figure 3). The positive relationships of corporate governance 
with external business environments, as well as organisational performance, are statistically 
significant at 1%. In addition, the total effect of the external business environments on 
organisational performance is 0.33, while the direct effect is 0.15 and the indirect effect 
through corporate governance is 0.18 (=0.33*0.54). 

These findings suggest the mediating role of corporate governance in the research model. The 

EBE OPE 
(R2 = 0.12***) 

0.33***

EBE

CGO

OPE

0.54***

(R2 = 0.11***) 

(R2 = 0.38***) 
0.33*** 
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results of the mediation test presented in Table 4 offers empirical evidence of the indirect 
effect of external business environments to organisational performance through corporate 
governance. The causal link from external business environments to organisational 
performance is statistically mediated by corporate governance at the significance level of 1%, 
with t-statistics (indirect) of 5.755, in support of Hypothesis 4. It can be therefore concluded 
that when corporate governance is included in the research model, the influence of external 
business environments uncertainty on organisational performance is partially transmitted 
through it. As a consequence, the influence will decrease. 

Table 4. Results for testing the mediating effect 
Mediator Causal effect tindirect Pvalue 

CGO EBE on OPE 5.755 0.000 

5. Discussion and conclusions 

The research findings shed insight on the complicated relationships among external business 
environments, corporate governance and organisational performance. This study provides 
statistical support for the argument that the uncertainty of external business environments has a 
significant influence on organisational performance, revealing that executives facing a high 
level of uncertainty in their external business environments become more concerned about 
organisational performance. This is consistent with the findings of Pelham (1999), Nicolaescu 
(2012) and Ajayi (2016), which state that higher environmental uncertainty makes firms use 
their limited resources more effectively and efficiently. This may help them gain a competitive 
advantage over their business rivals. 

This study also emphasises the relationships of corporate governance with organisational 
performance and external business environments. In the context of corporate governance, 
previous research (Choe 2003; Soltani 2005; Heinrich et al. 2007; Nicholson and Kiel 2007; 
Bhagat and Bolton 2008; Altunoglu 2012) argues that the uncertainty of external business 
environments pushes firms to develop better corporate governance, which results in a better 
system of management and better organisational performance is achieved. In this way, the 
firms survive and develop in an increasingly competitive external business environment. This 
research takes this theoretical contention and offers empirical verification that corporate 
governance is statistically supported as a consequence of external business environments, but 
as a causal factor of organisational performance. This is consistent with most of the previous 
findings (e.g., Choe 2003; Bhagat and Bolton 2008; Aguilera et al. 2008; Volberda et al. 2012; 
Adeoye and Elegunde 2012; Abdallah and Persson 2014; Afolabi 2015; Vo 2015). However, 
these results contradict the findings of Weir and Laing (2001), that report an unclear 
connection between corporate governance and organisational performance. This inconsistency 
could be related to the difference in the empirical context in that one study was performed in 
the UK, a developed country, and the other in Vietnam, a developing country. 

Finally, the current research highlights and focuses on the important role of corporate 
governance in the research model. The findings offer significant support for the indirect effect 
of external business environments on organisational performance. This is mediated through 
corporate governance, which is an important extension of the extant management literature of 
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the simply causal relationships among external business environments, corporate governance 
and organisational performance. This hypothesises a theoretical contention, rather than a direct 
effect. External business environments indirectly contribute to organisational performance via 
corporate governance by the mediating mechanism.  

This insight reflects the essential role of corporate governance in business activities in which 
corporate governance should appropriately respond to the uncertainty of external business 
environments to achieve competitive advantages and gain the best possible organisational 
performance. More significantly, the corporate governance model in this study has been 
statistically explored in the context of an emerging economy in Asia (including Vietnam), 
which has received little attention in terms of corporate governance (Ahmad et al. 2003). 
Therefore, this finding can be an extension of the existing literature on corporate governance 
theory to developing Asian countries.  

Furthermore, this research provides some implications for business managers and practitioners, 
shedding light on the important role of corporate governance in improving organisational 
performance. With that new knowledge, executive officers could decide to fit corporate 
governance with the uncertainty of the external business environments facing the firms. This 
would boost sustainable business development and transmit the uncertainty of external 
business environments into better organisational performance. 

6. Limitations and future directions 

The author acknowledges some limitations of this investigation. First, the data used in the 
research is based on survey responses offered by a single respondent in each firm. Hence, a bias 
problem can exist, because different respondents across firms are pooled into a single dataset 
(Bou-Llusar 2016). Future research should employ multiple-informant research designs to 
eradicate the potential bias problem. Second, this study was performed in Vietnam, as an 
emerging business environment in Asia. However, the findings are expected to be applied to 
other emerging business environments. Business conditions among emerging business 
environments may be dissimilar (Tu 2012). Therefore, care must be taken in generalizing these 
results. Furthermore, there is an inconsistency in the link between corporate governance and 
organisational performance. Future research should compare the relationship between 
developed and developing business environments. 
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