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Abstract 

Psychological factors have been significantly confirmed in athletic performance, sports injury 
prevention, sports rehabilitation, and as an effective means of managing stress and anxiety in 
competitions. The aim of this study was to investigate the effect of competitive anxiety on the 
injury level of student-athletes of Karadeniz Technical University. 

The method of this research is descriptive and correlational. The statistical population 
includes all athletes of Karadeniz Technical University, which are equal to 320 people. To 
determine the sample size, Cochran’s sample size estimation formula was used and the 
number of samples was 175, the gender random sampling method selected. First, to report 
sports injuries to describe the extent of injuries in the limbs (upper limbs, lower limbs, and 
trunk) and different parts of the body (joints, muscles, and bones), the report form of sports 
injuries was used and SCAT questionnaire was used to measure competitive anxiety. We 
analyzed data using SPSS software. We used regression because of the normality of the data 
in competitive anxiety tests and the occurrence of sports injuries. 

The research findings show that the average competitive anxiety of male athletes is 14.11 and 
the competitive anxiety of female athletes is 14.49. Competitive anxiety also has a significant 
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positive effect on sports injury. The beta coefficient also shows that competitive anxiety 
predicts 0.33 changes in sports injury. 

Therefore, it can be said that as the level of competitive anxiety of athletic students increases, 
so does their level of injury, and to control sports injuries, mental skills should be increased 
and we should control the competitive anxiety of athletes. 

Keywords: Competitive anxiety, Sports injury, Athletes 

1. Introduction 

The impact of psychological factors on performing sports skills, prevention of sports injuries, 
sports rehabilitation, and as an effective tool for managing stress and anxiety in competitions 
has been confirmed by various researches. In general, the causes of injuries in athletes can be 
classified into both physical and psychological categories (Armatas et al., 2007). 

In recent years, participation in competitive sports at the university level has increased 
significantly. Along with this increase, the prevalence of injuries has also increased compared 
to the past, so that today sports injuries and collisions are the principal reasons for disability 
in young athletes (Steffen et al., 2009). As a result, the demand for services provided by 
pathology and medical-sports specialists is increasing. Exercise-related injuries account for a 
high percentage of all injuries reported in medical centers during the year (Weinberg & Gould, 
2014). Research shows that 50 percent of college athletes suffer from some form of physical 
injury during a match season (Maddison & Prapavessis, 2007). 

Sports injuries are caused by a physical activity that is done to spend leisure time or a more 
specialized purpose. These injuries may also result from accidents or overwork (excessive 
activity) and are not necessarily different from injuries from non-athletic activities. Many 
sports injuries are insignificant and do not prevent ordinary athletes from engaging in daily 
activities. But for people who exercise seriously, daily activities are no longer the only issue. 
Injuries must be effectively treated to enable recreational activities at the earliest opportunity 
(Alizadeh et al., 2006). 

Sports injuries are injuries that occur as a result of severe injuries or excessive and excessive 
stretching during sports movements and have a wide range in terms of type and location of 
the injury. Research shows that in most sports, most we relate injuries to the lower limbs 
(Abernethy & Bleakley, 2007). Shojauddin et al. (2008) in a study of student-athletes showed 
that the lower limbs with 35.7% had the highest rate of injury, and the head and face with 
11.27% had the lowest rate of injury. This information is vital for medical-athletic team 
members because they are responsible for the immediate care of athletes. Although the 
principal focus of these individuals should be on the prevention and treatment of physical 
injuries, it is important to be aware of athletes’ mental states and how they relate to the 
context of their injuries (Glick & Horsfall, 2001). 

According to various studies, several psychological factors may play a role in sports injuries, 
the most important of which are highly competitive anxiety, low self-esteem, high stress, 
lifestyle changes, and reduced social support. Shahbazi et al. (2011) and Bigler et al. (2014) 
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in their research confirmed the effect of psychological factors on sports injury. Also, some 
psychological factors strengthen and improve the performance of athletes; strengthening 
these factors reduces the risk of injury and speeds up the recovery process of sports injuries 
(Johnson, 2006). Some researchers believe that anxiety in sports competitions, anxiety, and 
mental states is related to the number of injuries, and factors such as violence, hostility, and 
negative mental states are effective in the severity of injury (Hardy, 1992). 

In psychology, anxiety is the body’s natural response to danger. Anxiety is not uncommon, it 
is unpleasant when the athlete is upset and anxious for no apparent reason, in which case he 
loses his efficiency and will be in great danger at the competition (Weinberg & Gould, 2014). 

Anxiety is one of the most controversial and important issues in psychology and affects all 
psychological and physical dimensions of human beings. All the humans have experienced 
anxiety. Some life events warn us we are in a dangerous situation. Under these circumstances, 
anxiety is a natural reaction, because the job of anxiety is to mobilize the body’s defenses 
(Gunnoe et al., 2001). 

Eskandari et al. (2016) concluded that there is a direct and significant relationship between 
the level of sports anxiety (physical, cognitive, and decentralization) and the total amount of 
sports injuries that occurred to athletes during competitions, as well as the past year. Gunnoe 
et al. (2001) reported in a study that players with acute anxiety are more likely to be injured 
and the percentage of different injuries is higher (Gunnoe et al., 2001). Rezaei (2005) has 
concluded in his research that there is a significant relationship between competitive anxiety 
and the prevalence of sports injuries in wrestling and handball. However, some research has 
shown that competitive anxiety does not affect sports injury, including Weiss (2003) and 
Smith et al. (1994) and Velayati et al. (2012). 

We can associate anxiety with physical problems (physical anxiety) and have a negative 
effect on people’s thinking and cognition (cognitive anxiety or worry) and can disrupt 
athletes’ focus. Following this decrease in concentration, we expose athletes to injury 
(Weinberg & Gould, 2014). 

Due to the fact that studies on the relationship between competitive anxiety level and injury 
rate are very limited and also the need to conduct studies to examine injured and uninjured 
athletic students in terms of anxiety level, in this study, the effect of competitive anxiety on 
the injury level of student-athletes of Karadeniz Technical University has been investigated 
and its effect on the injury of athlete students has been studied. 

2. Method 

The method of this research is descriptive and correlational. The statistical population 
includes all athletes of Karadeniz Technical University, which are equal to 320 people. To 
determine the sample size, Cochran’s sample size estimation formula was used and the 
number of samples was 175, the gender random sampling method selected. 

In the first step, we measured the level of competitive anxiety of athletic students using the 
Sports Competitive Anxiety Questionnaire (SCAT). The SCAT sports Competitive anxiety is 



Journal of Educational Issues 
ISSN 2377-2263 

2020, Vol. 6, No. 2 

www.macrothink.org/jei 101

a test for measuring competitive anxiety in sports. The test was developed in 1976 by 
Martinez in the United States after five years of testing on 4,000 subjects. This questionnaire 
has 21 phrases for measuring 3 subscales of physical anxiety (9 articles), cognitive anxiety (7 
articles), and decentralization (5 articles) (Wilson & Syrotuik, 2000). 

The validity and reliability of this test have been obtained, and several studies and researchers 
have reported the high validity and reliability of this test. For example, the research of 
Martens (1977, 1987) measured the validity and reliability of this test and stated that this 
questionnaire has acceptable standards for psychological tests. 

In the second step, in order to evaluate sports injuries to describe the extent of injuries in the 
limbs (upper limbs, lower limbs and trunk) and different parts of the body (joints, muscles, 
and bones), the reporting form of sports injuries is used, and the required information is based 
on interviews with athletes and information on the type and severity of injuries were obtained 
according to their medical records. They compiled this form in a study by Rezaei (2005) and 
we reported its validity to be 0.78. In this study, we recorded injuries that occurred during 
training or competition, during which the injured player could not participate in the training 
session or the next day’s match of the team. At this stage, the coaches of the teams were 
asked to write about the injuries of the players in the injury registration form (Soligard et al., 
2010). 

Also, age, sex, injury status (competition or training), and sports were determined in the first 
questionnaire and descriptive statistics methods of competitive anxiety and prevalence were 
determined using SPSS software. Because of the normality of the data in psychological tests 
and the occurrence of sports injuries, regression was used. 

3. Results 

 

Table 1. Demographic information 

Weight Height Age Var. 

68.95 172.04 23.67 Mean 

6.75 3.62 1.11 Standard deviation 

 

According to the results of the table above, the average age of student-athletes is 23.67, their 
average height is 172.04 and the average weight of student-athletes is equal to 68.95. 

 

Table 2. Average and standard deviation of athletes’ competitive anxiety in terms of gender 

Standard deviation Mean Gender 

1.19 14.11 Male 

1.27 14.49 Female 
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According to the results of the above table, the average competitive anxiety of male athletes 
is 14.11 and the competitive anxiety of female athletes is 14.49. 

 

Table 3. Summary of regression model the effect of competitive anxiety on sports injury 

Adjusted R Square R Square R 

.09 .10 .33 

 

According to the results of Table 3, the correlation coefficient between competitive anxiety 
and sports injury is 0.33 and the coefficient of determination is 0.10. In other words, it can be 
said that 0.10 changes in sports injuries are determined by competitive anxiety and 0.90 are 
determined by other variables. 

 

Table 4. The results of the simple regression equation effect of competitive anxiety on sports 
injury 

Model Unstandardized CoefficientsStandardized Coefficientst Sig. 

B Std. Error Beta 

1
(Constant) 1.021 .121  7.99 .000 

Competitive anxiety.297 .033 .331 7.782 .000 

 

According to the results of Table 4 and considering the significant level of test error for the 
confidence level of 0.95, it can be said that competitive anxiety has a significant positive 
effect on sports injury. The beta coefficient also shows that competitive anxiety predicts 0.33 
changes in sports injury. 

4. Discussion 

Research has shown that athletes who practice mental skills are less likely to be injured than 
other athletes. However, little research has been done on the level of competitive anxiety with 
the injury. Therefore, the aim of the present study was to investigate the effect of competitive 
anxiety on the injury level of student-athletes of Karadeniz Technical University. 

According to the results of the research, competitive anxiety has a significant positive effect 
on sports injury. The beta coefficient also shows that competitive anxiety predicts 0.33 
changes in sports injury. In other words, with the increase in the level of sports competition 
among Karadeniz Technical University sports students, the rate of sports injuries among them 
will also increase. 

In general, research on psychological characteristics, especially in the field of sports and 
exercise, is controversial. 
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Some researchers immediately linked psychological traits to athlete injury, and another group 
believed that it was not significant. 

Shahbazi et al. (2011) examined the relationship between mental skills and sports injuries in 
athletes present at the Student Sports Olympiad and found a significant relationship between 
cognitive skills and sports injuries. Bigler et al. (2014) also stated in a study that there is a 
significant relationship between basic mental skills, psychosomatic skills, and cognitive skills 
with the number of injuries of football players. Also, Ivarsson and Johnson (2010) in a study 
conducted with the presence of 152 male and female football players, introduced 
psychological factors as predictors of sports injuries. Kleinert (2007) also stated that they can 
associate psychological and personality factors with the injury. 

The results of the research are consistent with the results of Eskandari et al. (2016) research. 
In their study, they concluded that there was a direct and significant relationship between the 
level of sports anxiety (physical, cognitive, and decentralization) and the total amount of 
sports injuries that occurred to athletes during competitions and the past year. The results of 
the study are consistent with the findings of Gonavi et al. (2001). In one study, they reported 
that players with acute anxiety were more likely to be injured and that the percentage of 
various injuries was higher (Gunnoe et al., 2001). The results are also consistent with 
Rezaei’s (2005) research findings, which show that there is a significant relationship between 
competitive anxiety and the prevalence of sports injuries in wrestling and handball. These 
results are consistent with Galambos et al. (2005) research and findings of Ford et al. (2000) 
research. Athletes with high levels of anxiety are more likely to be injured, they say. 

However, the results of the study are not consistent with the findings of the Velayati study et 
al. Because in their research, they concluded that there was no significant difference between 
the mean score of competitive sports anxiety disorder of injured and uninjured elite 
basketball players. Therefore, it seems that competitive sports anxiety has nothing to do with 
sports injuries in Iran’s elite basketball players. 

Research shows that athletes need to have the necessary mental skills to deal with stress and 
anxiety, and athletes with high competency in controlling competitive anxiety are less likely 
to be injured than other athletes. Low anxiety can be helpful sometimes to compete with 
athletes and motivate competition, but increasing anxiety reduces balance, reduces 
coordination between body parts, and ultimately reduces concentration, which can lead to 
injury among athletes because of Losing balance and falling, colliding with the opposing 
player and twisting the leg and other limbs (Johnson, 2006). 

A person with a high level of anxiety often behaves disproportionately in threatening 
situations, for example, it causes losing focus of the athlete, disrupting the regulation of a 
physical activity that is involved in the possibility of injury, and thus increasing the risk of 
injury (Nideffer, 1983). 

In general, it can be said that if a person’s perception causes an imbalance between needs and 
the person’s ability to respond, he or she will feel fear, resulting in increased anxiety. With 
this increase, anxiety (cognitive anxiety), physiological activity (physical anxiety) peaks, and 
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is accompanied by other responses such as changes in attention and concentration, and in 
general, all these factors lead to the disorder in the individual and Increasing the likelihood of 
injury for him. Despite all the facilities and conditions, there may still be a risk of injury, and 
any injury may have serious psychological consequences that can cause anxiety. 

Acknowledgments 

Therefore, ways to prevent injury and anxiety should be identified and we should take 
necessary measures in relation to them. 

Given that it significantly related the level of sports anxiety in this study to the amount of 
sports injuries, we recommend it to reduce stress and reduce the extent of sports injuries by 
using stress management methods and controlling athletes’ psychological factors. The ability 
to deal with psychological factors, including anxiety, is a neutralizing factor in reducing the 
risk of injury. Due to the fact that stressors may depend on the inside or outside of the 
exercise field, stress management mechanisms should be identified and applied. One of the 
basic and simplest neutralizers of stress management seems to be social support from special 
people. To this end, the level of awareness of coaches and those involved in sports should be 
increased in order to be aware of how to deal with the athlete and to avoid creating negative 
psychological and stress factors that may lead to injury. 

Physical education teachers, sports injury specialists, and sports psychologists are also 
advised to use mental training and educational strategies to try to improve cognitive skills and 
reduce anxiety in athletic students, thus reducing the risk of sports injuries in them. 
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